BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
POLK COUNTY, FLORIDA

NOTICE OF RECOMMENDED AWARD

DATE: September 29, 2015
BID NUMBER: 15-601-SM
BID TITLE: Pavement Management Alternative Methods
RECOMMENDED AWARD TO:

Pavement Technology, Inc. awarded: PC-002 [J

Asphalt Paving Systems awarded: PC-003 ALT, PC-004 ALT, PC-005 ALT, PC-006 ALT,
PC-007 ALT, PC-008 ALT, PC-009 ALT

BASED ON: Only Bid Submitted in those catagories

PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST: Tammy G. Spearman, CPPO, CPPB,

Any actual bidder or proposer who is allegedly aggrieved in connection with the solicitation or
pending award of a contract or bid may protest to the Procurement Director, in accordance with
the Procurement Policies and Procedures Manual. The procedures are available at the Polk
County Procurement Division at (863) 534-6757. Any person who wishes to file a protest on the
bid award may do so by submitting a non-refundable cashier’s check in the amount of $1,000.00
with their initial protest. Failure to follow the bid protest procedure requirements with the time
frames prescribed herein as established by Polk County, Florida, shall constitute a waiver of
your protest and any resulting claims. Deadline for filing protest: Friday, October 2, 2015 at
4:00 p.m. If no protests are received, the Procurement Director will award the project.




Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-002

Pavement | Asphalt Paving
Tech Systems
PC-002 ASPHALT REJUVENATOR
Item No. Description Unit Unit Price
PC-002 ASPHALT REJUVENATOR
PC-002-1 ASPHALT REJUVENATOR PER SPECIFICATION SY $0.78 No Bid
902-2 SILICA SAND 5% $0.02 No Bid
101-1 MOBILIZATION
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS $1,500.00 No Bid
Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,000 LS $1,200 .00 No Bid
Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,000 LS $1,000.00 No Bid
Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS $500 .00 No Bid
102-1 Maintenance of Traffice (MOT)
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day $800 .00 No Bid
BASIS FOR AWARD TOTAL BID: $5,000.80
ADDITIONAL PRICING FOR INFORMATION
PC-012 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS
PC-012-1 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA $1.10 No Bid
PC-012-2 FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA $5.50 No Bid
PC-012-3 FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA $5.50 No Bid
PC-012-4 FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA $5.50 No Bid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS
11-111 Standard, White, Solid 6" NM $1,742.00 No Bid
11-122 Standard, White, Solid 8" LF $0.55 No Bid
11-123 Standard, White, Solid 12" LF $1.65 No Bid
11-124 Standard, White, Solid 18" LF $2.47 No Bid
11-125 Standard, White, Solid 24" LF $3.30 No Bid
11-131 Standard, White Skip 6" GM $580.00 No Bid
11-151 Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF $0.55 No Bid
11- 160 Standard, White, Message EA $55.00 No Bid
11-170 Standard, White, Arrows EA $27.50 No Bid
11-180 Standard, White,Yield Line LF $5.50 No Bid
11-211 Standard, Yellow , Solid 6" NM $1,742 .00 No Bid
11-222 Standard, Yellow , Solid 8" LF $0.55 No Bid
11-223 Standard, Yellow, Solid 12 " LF $1.65 No Bid
11-224 Standard, Yellow , Solid 18" LF $2 .47 No Bid
11-225 Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF $3.30 No Bid
11-231 Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM $726 .00 No Bid
11-251 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6= LF $0.55 No Bid
711 Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711)
11-111 Thermo, Standard,White, Solid 6" NM $4,356.00 No Bid
11-122 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF $1.32 No Bid
11-123 Thermo , Standard, White, Solid 12" LF $2.75 No Bid
11-124 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF $4.12 No Bid
11-125 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF $5 .50 No Bid
11- 131 Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM $1,234.00 No Bid
11-151 Thermo, Standard,White, Dotted/Guideline 6- 10 Gap, 6" LF $1.21 No Bid
11-160 Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA $209 .00 No Bid
11-170 Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA $66 .00 No Bid
11-180 Thermo, Standa rd,White, Yield Line LF $8.80 No Bid
11-211 Thermo, Standard,Yellow, Solid 6" NM $4,356 .00 No Bid
11-222 Thermo, Standard,Yellow, Solid 8" LF $1.21 No Bid
11-223 Thermo, Standard,Yellow, Solid 12" LF $2.75 No Bid
11-224 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF $4.12 No Bid
11-225 Thermo, Standard,Yellow, Solid 24" LF $5.50 No Bid
11-231 Thermo, Standard, Yellow , Skip 6" GM $1,234.00 No Bid
11-251 Thermo, Standard,Yellow , Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF $1.21 No Bid




Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-002-ALT. ASPHALT REJUVENATOR

PC-002 Alt NO BID

Company Name

Pavement | Asphalt

Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price Tech Paving

Systems
PC-002 |ASPHALT REJUVENATOR No Bid No Bid
PC-002-2 | ASPHALT REJUVENATOR - ALTERNATE MATERIAL SY No Bid No Bid
902-2 SILICA SAND SY No Bid No Bid
101-1 |MOBILIZATION No Bid No Bid
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS No Bid |No Bid
Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,000 LS No Bid |No Bid
Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,000 LS No Bid |No Bid
Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS No Bid |No Bid
102-1 |Maintenance of Traffice (MOT) No Bid |No Bid
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day No Bid |No Bid
PC-012 |REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS No Bid No Bid
PC-012-1 | REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA No Bid No Bid
PC-012-2 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA No Bid No Bid
PC-012-3 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA No Bid No Bid
PC-012-4 | FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA No Bid No Bid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS No Bid No Bid
11-111 Standard, White, Solid 6" NM No Bid |No Bid
11-122 Standard, White, Solid 8" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-123 Standard, White, Solid 12" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-124 Standard, White, Solid 18" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-125 Standard, White, Solid 24" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-131 Standard, White Skip 6" GM No Bid |No Bid
11-151 Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-160 Standard, White, Message EA No Bid |No Bid
11-170 Standard, White, Arrows EA No Bid |No Bid
11-180 Standard, White, Yield Line LF No Bid |No Bid
11-211 Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM No Bid |No Bid
11-222 Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-223 Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-224 Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-225 Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-231 Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM No Bid |No Bid
11-251 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF No Bid |No Bid
711 Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711) No Bid |No Bid
11-111 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 6" NM No Bid |No Bid
11-122 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-123 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 12" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-124 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-125 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-131 Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM No Bid |No Bid
11-151 Thermo, Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-160 Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA No Bid |No Bid
11-170 Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA No Bid |No Bid
11-180 Thermo, Standard, White, Yield Line LF No Bid |No Bid
11-211 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM No Bid |No Bid
11-222 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-223 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-224 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-225 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF No Bid |No Bid
11-231 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM No Bid |No Bid
11-251 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF No Bid |No Bid

BASIS FOR AWARD TOTAL BID: $0.00
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Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-003 CRACK SEALING

Asphalt
Paving

Systems |Pavement Tech
Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
PC-003 |CRACK SEALING No Bid
0-500 GAL 20 No Bid
501 - 1,000 GAL 18 No Bid
1,001 - 5,000 GAL 16 No Bid
5,001 AND OVER GAL 15 No Bid
101-1 |MOBILIZATION No Bid
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS 500 No Bid
Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,000 LS 200, No Bid
Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,000 LS 200, No Bid
Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS 200, No Bid
102-1 |Maintenance of Traffice (MOT) No Bid
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day 1250 No Bid

BASIS FOR AWARD TOTALBID: $2,419.00

ADDITIONAL PRICING FOR INFORMATION No Bid
PC-011 |STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKING REMOVAL No Bid
PC-011-1 | REMOVAL BY WATER BLASTING SF 1 No Bid
PC-011-2 | REMOVAL BY GRINDING SF 0.5 No Bid
PC-012 |REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS No Bid
PC-012-1 | REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA 1 No Bid
PC-012-2 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA 5 No Bid
PC-012-3 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA 5 No Bid
PC-012-4 | FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA 5 No Bid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS No Bid
11-111 Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 1585 No Bid
11-122 Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 0.5 No Bid
11-123 Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 1.5 No Bid
11-124 Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 2.25 No Bid
11-125 Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 3 No Bid
11-131 Standard, White Skip 6" GM 530 No Bid
11-151 Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5 No Bid
11-160 Standard, White, Message EA 50 No Bid
11-170 Standard, White, Arrows EA 25 No Bid
11-180 Standard, White, Yield Line LF 5 No Bid
11-211 Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 1585 No Bid
11-222 Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 0.5 No Bid
11-223 Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 1.5 No Bid
11-224 Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 2.25 No Bid
11-225 Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 3 No Bid
11-231 Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 675 No Bid
11-251 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5 No Bid
711 Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711) No Bid
11-111 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 4000, No Bid
11-122 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 1.2 No Bid
11-123 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 2.5 No Bid
11-124 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 3.75 No Bid
11-125 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 5 No Bid
11-131 Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM 1125 No Bid
11-151 Thermo, Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1 No Bid
11-160 Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA 190 No Bid
11-170 Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA 60 No Bid
11-180 Thermo, Standard, White, Yield Line LF 8 No Bid
11-211 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 4000, No Bid
11-222 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 1.1 No Bid
11-223 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 2.5 No Bid
11-224 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 3.75 No Bid
11-225 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 5 No Bid
11-231 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 1125 No Bid
11-251 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1 No Bid

PC-003
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Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-004 CHIP SEAL

Asphalt Pavement
Paving Tech
Systems
Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
PC-004-1 |CHIP SEAL (SINGLE APPLICATION) No Bid
0 - 25,000 SY 2.8| No Bid
25,001 - 50,000 SY 2.39| No Bid
50,001 AND OVER SY 2.26| No Bid
PC-004-2 |CHIP SEAL (DOUBLE APPLICATION) No Bid
0 - 25,000 SY 4.15| No Bid
25,001 - 50,000 SY 3.88| No Bid
50,001 AND OVER SY 3.78| No Bid
50,001 AND OVER SY 3.78| No Bid
902-2 Silica Sand SY 0.15| No Bid
PC-011 |STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKING REMOVAL No Bid
PC-011-1 | REMOVAL BY WATER BLASTING SF 1| No Bid
PC-011-2 | REMOVAL BY GRINDING SF 0.5| No Bid
PC-012 |REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS No Bid
PC-012-1 | REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA 1| NoBid
PC-012-2 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA 5| No Bid
PC-012-3 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA 5| No Bid
PC-012-4 | FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA 5| No Bid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS No Bid
11-111 Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 1585 No Bid
11-122 Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 0.5| No Bid
11-123 Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 1.5| No Bid
11-124 Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 2.25| No Bid
11-125 Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 3| No Bid
11-131 Standard, White Skip 6" GM 530| No Bid
11-151 Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6' LF 0.5 No Bid
11-160 Standard, White, Message EA 50| No Bid
11-170 Standard, White, Arrows EA 25| No Bid
11-180 Standard, White, Yield Line LF 5| No Bid
11-211 Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 1585 No Bid
11-222 Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 0.5| No Bid
11-223 Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 1.5| No Bid
11-224 Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 2.25| No Bid
11-225 Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 3| No Bid
11-231 Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 675| No Bid
11-251 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6' LF 0.5 No Bid
711 Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711) No Bid
11-111 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 4000{ No Bid
11-122 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 1.2| No Bid
11-123 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 2.5 No Bid
11-124 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 3.75| No Bid
11-125 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 5/ No Bid
11-131 Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM 1125 No Bid
11-151 Thermo, Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6' LF 1.1| No Bid
11-160 Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA 190| No Bid
11-170 Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA 60| No Bid
11-180 Thermo, Standard, White, Yield Line LF 8| No Bid
11-211 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 4000{ No Bid
11-222 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 1.1| No Bid
11-223 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 2.5 No Bid
11-224 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 3.75| No Bid
11-225 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 5/ No Bid
11-231 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 1125 No Bid
11-251 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6' LF 1.1| No Bid
101-1 |MOBILIZATION No Bid
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS 2500/ No Bid
Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,00C LS 2500{ No Bid
Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,00C LS 2500/ No Bid
Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS 2500{ No Bid
102-1 |Maintenance of Traffice (MOT) No Bid
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day 1250| No Bid
BASIS FOR AWARD TOTAL BID: $26,296.19
ADDITIONAL PRICING FOR INFORMATION No Bid
SHOULDER AND ROADSIDE No Bid
570-1-1 PERFORMANCE TURF - SEED AND MULCH SY 1.95| No Bid
570-1-2A | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (ST. AUGUSTINE) SY 2.75| No Bid
570-1-2B | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (BAHIA) SY 2.25| No Bid
577-70 SHOULDER REWORK SY 1.75| No Bid
104-13-1 | SILT FENCE TYPE Ill LF 0.85( No Bid
110-10 MAILBOX (REMOVE AND REPLACE) EA 200| No Bid

PC-004
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Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-005 MICRO-SURFACING

Asphalt
Paving Pavement
Systems Tech
Item No. Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
PC-003 CRACK SEALING No Bid
0-500 GAL 20| No Bid
501 - 1,000 GAL 18 No Bid
1,001 - 5,000 GAL 16 No Bid
5,001 AND OVER GAL 15| No Bid
PC-005 MICRO-SURFACCING No Bid
PC-005-1 SINGLE MICRO SY 2.25] No Bid
PC-005-2 DOUBLE MICRO SY 3.45] No Bid
PC-005-3 RUT FILLING TON 150 No Bid
PC-011 STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKING REMOVAL No Bid
PC-011-1 REMOVAL BY WATER BLASTING SF No Bid
PC-011-2 REMOVAL BY GRINDING SF 0.5 No Bid
PC-012 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS No Bid
PC-012-1 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA 1 No Bid
PC-012-2 FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA 5| No Bid
PC-012-3 FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA 5| No Bid
PC-012-4 FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA 5] No Bid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS No Bid
11-111 Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 1585 No Bid
11-122 Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 0.5 No Bid
11-123 Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 1.5 No Bid
11-124 Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 2.25 No Bid
11-125 Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 3 No Bid
11-131 Standard, White Skip 6" GM 530 No Bid
11-151 Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5 No Bid
11-160 Standard, White, M EA 50 No Bid
11-170 Standard, White, Arrows EA 25| No Bid
11-180 Standard, White, Yield Line LF 5 No Bid
11-211 Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 1585 No Bid
11-222 Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 0.5 No Bid
11-223 Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 1.5 No Bid
11-224 Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 2.25 No Bid
11-225 Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 3 No Bid
11-231 Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 675 No Bid
11-251 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5 No Bid
711 Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711) No Bid
11-111 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 4000 No Bid
11-122 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 1.2 No Bid
11-123 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 2.5 No Bid
11-124 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 3.75 No Bid
11-125 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 5 No Bid
11-131 Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM 1125 No Bid
11-151 Thermo, Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1 No Bid
11-160 Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA 190 No Bid
11-170 Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA 60 No Bid
11-180 Thermo, Standard, White, Yield Line LF 8 No Bid
11-211 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 4000 No Bid
11-222 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 1.1 No Bid
11-223 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 2.5 No Bid
11-224 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 3.75 No Bid
11-225 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 5 No Bid
11-231 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 1125 No Bid
11-251 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1 No Bid
101-1 MOBILIZATION No Bid
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS 1500 No Bid
Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,000 LS 1500 No Bid
Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,000 LS 1500 No Bid
Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS 1500 No Bid
102-1 Maintenance of Traffice (MOT) No Bid
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day 1250 No Bid
BASIS FOR AWARD TOTAL BID: $22,497.70
ADDITIONAL PRICING FOR INFORMATION No Bid
SHOULDER AND ROADSIDE No Bid
570-1-1 PERFORMANCE TURF - SEED AND MULCH SY 1.95 No Bid
570-1-2A PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (ST. AUGUSTINE) SY 2.75 No Bid
570-1-2B PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (BAHIA) SY 2.25 No Bid
577-70 SHOULDER REWORK SY 1.75 No Bid
104-13-1 SILT FENCE TYPE Ill LF 0.85] No Bid
110-10 MAILBOX (REMOVE AND REPLACE) EA 200 No Bid

PC-005
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Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-006 SCRUB SEAL

Asphalt
Paving Pavement
Systems Tech
Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
PC-006 [SCRUB SEAL No Bid
0 - 25,000 N 3.65] NoBid
25,001 - 50,000 SY 3.25| NoBid
50,001 AND OVER Sy 3.15] NoBid
PC-009 |FOG SEAL No Bid
0 - 25,000 Sy 0.55| NoBid
25,001 - 50,000 SY 0.4 NoBid
50,001 AND OVER N 0.35| NoBid
902-2 Silica Sand SY 0.15| NoBid
PC-011 |STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKING REMOVAL No Bid
PC-011-1 | REMOVAL BY WATER BLASTING SF 1 No Bid
PC-011-2 | REMOVAL BY GRINDING SF 0.5] NoBid
PC-012 |REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS No Bid
PC-012-1 | REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA 1| NoBid
PC-012-2 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA 5 No Bid
PC-012-3 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA 5| NoBid
PC-012-4 | FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA 5 No Bid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS No Bid
11-111 Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 1585| NoBid
11-122 Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 0.5| NoBid
11-123 Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 1.5| NoBid
11-124 Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 2.25| NoBid
11-125 Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 3] NoBid
11-131 Standard, White Skip 6" GM 530| NoBid
11-151 Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5| NoBid
11-160 Standard, White, Message EA 50| NoBid
11-170 Standard, White, Arrows EA 25| NoBid
11-180 Standard, White, Yield Line LF 5| NoBid
11-211 Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 1585| NoBid
11-222 Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 0.5/ NoBid
11-223 Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 1.5| NoBid
11-224 Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 2.25] NoBid
11-225 Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 3| NoBid
11-231 Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 675| NoBid
11-251 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5| NoBid
711 |Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711) No Bid
11-111 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 4000 NoBid
11-122 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 1.2| NoBid
11-123 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 2.5| NoBid
11-124 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 3.75| NoBid
11-125 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 5| NoBid
11-131 Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM 1125| NoBid
11-151 Thermo, Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6' LF 1.1 NoBid
11-160 Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA 190| NoBid
11-170 Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA 60| NoBid
11-180 Thermo, Standard, White, Yield Line LF 8| NoBid
11-211 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 4000 NoBid
11-222 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 1.1 NoBid
11-223 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 2.5| NoBid
11-224 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 3.75| NoBid
11-225 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 5| NoBid
11-231 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 1125| NoBid
11-251 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6' LF 1.1 NoBid
101-1 |MOBILIZATION No Bid
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS 2500/ NoBid
Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,00C LS 2500/ NoBid
Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,00C LS 2500 NoBid
Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS 2500/ NoBid
102-1  |Mair e of Traffice (MOT) No Bid
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day 1250 NoBid
BASIS FOR AWARD TOTAL BID: $26,284.50
ADDITIONAL PRICING FOR INFORMATION No Bid
SHOULDER AND ROADSIDE No Bid
570-1-1 PERFORMANCE TURF - SEED AND MULCH SY 1.95| NoBid
570-1-2A | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (ST. AUGUSTINE) SY 2.75 No Bid
570-1-2B | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (BAHIA) SY 2.25| NoBid
577-70 SHOULDER REWORK SY 1.75 No Bid
104-13-1 | SILT FENCE TYPE Il LF 0.85| NoBid
110-10 MAILBOX (REMOVE AND REPLACE) EA 200] NoBid

PC-006
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Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis PC-007
PC-007 COLD-IN-PLACE RECYCLING (CIP)
Asphalt Pavement
Paving Tech
Systems
Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
PC-001 |Milling from O to 1,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-001-1 0"-1" Sq Yd 6] No Bid
PC-001-2 1.01"-2" Sq Yd 8] No Bid
PC-001-3 2.01"-3" Sq Yd 9] No Bid
PC-001-4 3.01" -4" Sq Yd 10] No Bid
PC-001-5 greater than 4" Sq Yd 11] No Bid
Milling from 1,001 to 5,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-001-6 0"-1" Sq Yd 4.75] No Bid
PC-001-7 1.01"-2" Sq Yd 5.5] No Bid
PC-001-8 2.01"-3" Sq Yd 6.25| No Bid
PC-001-9 3.01" -4" Sq Yd 6.5] No Bid
PC-001-10 greater than 4" Sq Yd 6.75] No Bid
Milling from 5,001 to 25,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-001-11 0"-1" Sq Yd 2.5] No Bid
PC-001-12 1.01"-2" Sq Yd 3] No Bid
PC-001-13 2.01"-3" Sq Yd 3.5] NoBid
PC-001-14 3.01" -4" Sq Yd 4] No Bid
PC-001-15 greater than 4" Sq Yd 4.5] No Bid
Milling over 25,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-001-16 0"-1" Sq Yd 1.75| No Bid
PC-001-17 1.01"-2" Sq Yd 2.25| No Bid
PC-001-18 2.01"-3" Sq Yd 2.75] No Bid
PC-001-19 3.01" -4" Sq Yd 3.25| No Bid
PC-001-20 greater than 4" Sq Yd 3.75] No Bid
334 Asphalt Types from 0 to 100 Tons No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 109| No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 12.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 107| No Bid
337-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, FC-9.5) (PG 76-22) Ton 120] No Bid
334 Asphalt Types from 101 to 1,000 Tons No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 99| No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 12.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 97| No Bid
337-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, FC-9.5) (PG 76-22) Ton 110] No Bid
334 Asphalt Types over 1,001 Tons No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 94| No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 12.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 92| No Bid
337-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, FC-9.5) (PG 76-22) Ton 105| No Bid
PC-007 |Cold-in-Place Recycling (CIP) No Bid
PC-007-1 |Excavation for Widening or Unsuitable Material cY 25| No Bid
PC-007-2 |Added RAP or Aggregate Ton 18] No Bid
CIP from 0 to 25,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-007-3 Cold-in-Place Recycling (CIP)Bituminous Paving Sq Yd 7.25| No Bid
PC-007-4 Asphalt Emulsion Gal 2.45| No Bid
CIP from 25,001 to 50,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-007-5 Cold-in-Place Recycling (CIP)Bituminous Paving Sq Yd 5.75| No Bid
PC-007-6 Asphalt Emulsion Gal 2.45| No Bid
CIP over 50,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-007-7 Cold-in-Place Recycling (CIP)Bituminous Paving Sq Yd 4.95| No Bid
PC-007-8 Asphalt Emulsion Gal 2.45| No Bid
SHOULDER AND ROADSIDE No Bid
570-1-1 PERFORMANCE TURF - SEED AND MULCH SY 1.95| No Bid
570-1-2A | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (ST. AUGUSTINE) SY 2.75|] No Bid
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Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis PC-007
PC-007 COLD-IN-PLACE RECYCLING (CIP)

Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
570-1-2B | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (BAHIA) SY 2.25] No Bid
577-70 SHOULDER REWORK SY 1.75] No Bid
104-13-1 | SILT FENCE TYPE llI LF 0.85] No Bid
110-10 MAILBOX (REMOVE AND REPLACE) EA 200] No Bid
PC-012 |REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS No Bid
PC-012-1 | REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA 1| No Bid
PC-012-2 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA 5] No Bid
PC-012-3 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA 5] No Bid
PC-012-4 | FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA 5] No Bid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS No Bid
11-111 Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 1585| No Bid
11-122 Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 0.5] No Bid
11-123 Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 1.5] No Bid
11-124 Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 2.25] No Bid
11-125 Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 3] No Bid
11-131 Standard, White Skip 6" GM 530] No Bid
11-151 Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5] NoBid
11-160 Standard, White, Message EA 50| No Bid
11-170 Standard, White, Arrows EA 25] No Bid
11-180 Standard, White, Yield Line LF 5] No Bid
11-211 Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 1585| No Bid
11-222 Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 0.5] No Bid
11-223 Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 1.5] No Bid
11-224 Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 2.25] No Bid
11-225 Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 3] No Bid
11-231 Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 675] No Bid
11-251 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5] NoBid
711 Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711) No Bid
11-111 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 4000 No Bid
11-122 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 1.2| NoBid
11-123 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 2.5] No Bid
11-124 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 3.75] No Bid
11-125 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 5] No Bid
11-131 Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM 1125] No Bid
11-151 Thermo, Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1] No Bid
11-160 Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA 190| No Bid
11-170 Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA 60] No Bid
11-180 Thermo, Standard, White, Yield Line LF 8] No Bid
11-211 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 4000 No Bid
11-222 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 1.1] NoBid
11-223 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 2.5] No Bid
11-224 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 3.75] NoBid
11-225 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 5] No Bid
11-231 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 1125] No Bid
11-251 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1] No Bid
101-1 MOBILIZATION No Bid
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS 7000 No Bid
Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,000 LS 7000 No Bid
Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,000 LS 7000 No Bid
Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS 7000] No Bid
102-1 |Maintenance of Traffice (MOT) No Bid
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day 1250| No Bid

BASIS FOR AWARD

TOTAL BID: $45,587.35
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Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-008 FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION (FDR)

PC-008

Asphalt

Paving Pavement
Systems Tech
Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
PC-001 |Milling from 0 to 1,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-001-1 o"-1" Sq Yd 6| NoBid
PC-001-2 1.01"-2" Sqvd 8|l NoBid
PC-001-3 2.01"-3" Sq Yd 9| NoBid
PC-001-4 3.01"-4" Sqvd 10|l NoBid
PC-001-5 greater than 4" Sq Yd 11| NoBid
Milling from 1,001 to 5,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-001-6 o"-1" Sq Yd 4.75] NoBid
PC-001-7 1.01"-2" Sqvd 5.5] NoBid
PC-001-8 2.01"-3" Sq Yd 6.25] NoBid
PC-001-9 3.01"-4" Sqvd 6.5] NoBid
PC-001-10 greater than 4" Sq Yd 6.75]1 NoBid
Milling from 5,001 to 25,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-001-11 o"-1" Sq Yd 2.5] NoBid
PC-001-12 1.01"-2" Sqvd 3] NoBid
PC-001-13 2.01"-3" Sq Yd 3.5] NoBid
PC-001-14 3.01"-4" Sqvd 4] NoBid
PC-001-15 greater than 4" Sq Yd 4.5] NoBid
Milling over 25,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-001-16 o"-1" Sq Yd 1.75] No Bid
PC-001-17 1.01"-2" Sqvd 2.25] NoBid
PC-001-18 2.01"-3" Sq Yd 2.75] NoBid
PC-001-19 3.01"-4" Sqvd 3.25] NoBid
PC-001-20 greater than 4" Sq Yd 3.75]1 NoBid
334 Asphalt Types from 0 to 100 Tons No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 109] NoBid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 12.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 107] NoBid
337-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, FC-9.5) (PG 76-22) Ton 120] NoBid
334 Asphalt Types from 101 to 1,000 Tons No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 99| NoBid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 12.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 97| NoBid
337-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, FC-9.5) (PG 76-22) Ton 110] NoBid
334 Asphalt Types over 1,001 Tons No Bid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 9.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 94| NoBid
334-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, SP 12.5) (PG 67-22) Ton 92| NoBid
337-1 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete (Traffic C, FC-9.5) (PG 76-22) Ton 105] NoBid
PC-008 |Full Depth Reclamation (FDR) No Bid
PC-008-1 Excavation for Widening or Unsuitable Material cy 25| NoBid
PC-008-2 Added RAP or Aggregate Ton 18] NoBid
Full Depth Reclamation (FDR) from 0 to 25,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-008-3 Pulverization Sq Yd 7.1l NoBid
PC-008-4 Cement - Cement Treatment Ton 145] No Bid
PC-008-5 Asphaltic Cement - Foamed Asphalt Base Gallon 6] NoBid
PC-008-6 Asphaltic Emulsion - Emulsion Treated Base Gallon 2.45] NoBid
Full Depth Reclamation (FDR) from 25,001 to 50,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-008-7 Pulverization Sq Yd 5.5] NoBid
PC-008-8 Cement - Cement Treatment Ton 145] NoBid
PC-008-9 Asphaltic Cement - Foamed Asphalt Base Gallon 6| NoBid
PC-008-10 Asphaltic Emulsion - Emulsion Treated Base Gallon 2.45] NoBid
Full Depth Reclamation (FDR) over 50,000 Square Yards No Bid
PC-008-11 Pulverization Sq Yd 4.5] NoBid
PC-008-12| Cement - Cement Treatment Ton 145| NoBid
PC-008-13 Asphaltic Cement - Foamed Asphalt Base Gallon 6] NoBid
PC-008-14 | Asphaltic Emulsion - Emulsion Treated Base Gallon 2.45] NoBid
SHOULDER AND ROADSIDE No Bid
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Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-008 FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION (FDR)

PC-008

Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
570-1-1 PERFORMANCE TURF - SEED AND MULCH SY 1.95] NoBid
570-1-2A | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (ST. AUGUSTINE) SY 2.75] NoBid
570-1-2B | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (BAHIA) SY 2.25] NoBid
577-70 SHOULDER REWORK SY 1.75] NoBid
104-13-1 | SILT FENCE TYPE Il LF 0.85] NoBid
110-10 MAILBOX (REMOVE AND REPLACE) EA 200] NoBid
PC-012 |REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS No Bid
PC-012-1 | REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA 1] NoBid
PC-012-2 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA 5| NoBid
PC-012-3 | FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA 5| NoBid
PC-012-4 | FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA 5| NoBid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS No Bid
11-111 Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 1585| NoBid
11-122 Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 0.5] NoBid
11-123 Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 1.5] NoBid
11-124 Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 2.25] NoBid
11-125 Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 3| NoBid
11-131 Standard, White Skip 6" GM 530] NoBid
11-151 Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5] NoBid
11-160 Standard, White, Message EA 50] NoBid
11-170 Standard, White, Arrows EA 25] NoBid
11-180 Standard, White, Yield Line LF 5] NoBid
11-211 Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 1585] No Bid
11-222 Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 0.5] NoBid
11-223 Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 1.5] NoBid
11-224 Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 2.25] NoBid
11-225 Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 3] NoBid
11-231 Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 675| NoBid
11-251 Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5] NoBid
711 Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711) No Bid
11-111 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 4000 NoBid
11-122 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 1.2] NoBid
11-123 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 2.5] NoBid
11-124 | Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 3.75] NoBid
11-125 Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 5] NoBid
11-131 Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM 1125] NoBid
11-151 Thermo, Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1] NoBid
11-160 | Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA 190] NoBid
11-170 Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA 60| NoBid
11-180 | Thermo, Standard, White, Yield Line LF 8| NoBid
11-211 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 4000] NoBid
11-222 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 1.1] NoBid
11-223 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 2.5] NoBid
11-224 | Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 3.75] NoBid
11-225 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 5] NoBid
11-231 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 1125| NoBid
11-251 Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1] NoBid
101-1 | MOBILIZATION No Bid
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS 7000] No Bid

Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,000 LS 7000] NoBid

Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,000 LS 7000] No Bid

Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS 7000] NoBid

102-1 |Maintenance of Traffice (MOT) No Bid
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day 1250| NoBid

BASIS FOR AWARD

TOTALBID: $46,039.50

Page 10 of 11



Bid 15-601 Bid Analysis

PC-009 FOG SEAL

Asphalt Paﬁ?ﬁ nt
Paving
Systems
Item No. |Description Unit Unit Price No Bid
PC-009 |FOG SEAL No Bid
0 - 25,000 SY 0.55| No Bid
25,001 - 50,000 SY 0.4| No Bid
50,001 AND OVER SY 0.35| No Bid
902-2 |Silica Sand SY 0.15| No Bid
PC-011 |STRIPING AND PAVEMENT MARKING REMOVAL No Bid
PC-011-1 |[REMOVAL BY WATER BLASTING SF No Bid
PC-011-2 |REMOVAL BY GRINDING SF 0.5 No Bid
PC-012 |REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS No Bid
PC-012-1 |REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (REMOVE) EA 1| No Bid
PC-012-2 |FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (A/A) EA 5| No Bid
PC-012-3 |FURNISH/INSTALL BI-DIRECTIONAL WHITE/RED MARKER (C/R) EA 5| No Bid
PC-012-4 |FURNISH/INSTALL MONO-DIRECTIONAL YELLOW MARKER (M/A) EA 5| No Bid
710 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS No Bid
11-111 |Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 1585| No Bid
11-122 |Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 0.5 No Bid
11-123 |[Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 1.5| No Bid
11-124 |Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 2.25| No Bid
11-125 |[Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 3| NoBid
11-131 |[Standard, White Skip 6" GM 530| No Bid
11-151 |Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5| No Bid
11-160 |[Standard, White, Message EA 50| No Bid
11-170 |[Standard, White, Arrows EA 25| No Bid
11-180 |Standard, White, Yield Line LF 5[ No Bid
11-211 |[Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 1585| No Bid
11-222 |Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 0.5 No Bid
11-223 |[Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 1.5| No Bid
11-224 |Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 2.25| No Bid
11-225 |[Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 3| NoBid
11-231 |[Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 675| No Bid
11-251 |Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 0.5| No Bid
711 Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (711) No Bid
11-111 |Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 6" NM 4000| No Bid
11-122 |Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 8" LF 1.2| No Bid
11-123 |Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 12" LF 2.5/ No Bid
11-124 |Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 18" LF 3.75| No Bid
11-125 |[Thermo, Standard, White, Solid 24" LF 5/ No Bid
11-131 |Thermo, Standard, White Skip 6" GM 1125| No Bid
11-151 |Thermo, Standard, White, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1| No Bid
11-160 |Thermo, Standard, White, Message EA 190( No Bid
11-170 |Thermo, Standard, White, Arrows EA 60| No Bid
11-180 |Thermo, Standard, White, Yield Line LF 8| No Bid
11-211 |Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 6" NM 4000| No Bid
11-222 |Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 8" LF 1.1 No Bid
11-223 |Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 12" LF 2.5/ No Bid
11-224 |Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 18" LF 3.75| No Bid
11-225 |[Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Solid 24" LF 5| No Bid
11-231 |Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Skip 6" GM 1125| No Bid
11-251 |Thermo, Standard, Yellow, Dotted/Guideline 6-10 Gap, 6" LF 1.1| No Bid
101-1 |MOBILIZATION No Bid
Work Order Total $0.00 - $50,000 LS 200| No Bid
Work Order Total $50,001 - $100,000 LS 200| No Bid
Work Order Total $100,001 - $500,000 LS 200| No Bid
Work Order Total Over $500,000 LS 200| No Bid
No Bid
102-1 |Maintenance of Traffice (MOT) No Bid
Standard Index 600 Series MOT for 2-Lane, 2-Way Closure Per Day 1250( No Bid
BASIS FOR AWARD TOTAL BID: $17,074.45
ADDITIONAL PRICING FOR INFORMATION No Bid
SHOULDER AND ROADSIDE No Bid
570-1-1 PERFORMANCE TURF - SEED AND MULCH SY 1.95| No Bid
570-1-2A | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (ST. AUGUSTINE) SY 2.75 No Bid
570-1-2B | PERFORMANCE TURF - SOD (BAHIA) SY 2.25| No Bid
577-70 SHOULDER REWORK SY 1.75| No Bid
104-13-1 | SILT FENCE TYPE IlI LF 0.85| No Bid
110-10 MAILBOX (REMOVE AND REPLACE) EA 200| No Bid

PC-009
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